

WYOMING COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT  
**ASPHALTIC CONCRETE**

Materials, Delivery & Rented Equipment/Labor

Bidder's List

- x County Line Stone Co., Inc  
4515 Crittenden Road, PO Box 150  
Akron, NY 14001  
716-542-5435
  
- x D & H Excavating Inc  
11939 State Route 98  
Arcade, NY 14009  
716-492-4956
  
- x Gernatt Asphalt Products, Inc.  
13870 Taylor Hollow Road  
Collins, NY 14034  
716-532-3371
  
- x Hanson Aggregates New York LLC  
6895 Ellicott Street  
Pavilion, NY 14525  
585-584-3132
  
- x Ed Hulme Inc.  
17 E. Buffalo Rd  
Warsaw, NY 14569  
585-786-5880
  
- x Keeler Construction  
13519 West Lee Rd  
Albion, NY 14411  
585-589-4481
  
- x Spallina Materials, Inc.  
PO Box 89  
West Bloomfield, NY 14585  
585-657-8001

WYOMING COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT  
ASPHALTIC CONCRETE

Bids Opened: 3/15/22

Price/Ton F.O.B. Plant

Contract Period : 04/1/2022 - 11/15/2022

Asphalt Binder Type	Item No	Item & Type	Base Nov 2021 570	County Line Stone Co., Inc.	WMA ADDITIONAL COST PER TON	Gernatt Asphalt - Delevan	WMA ADDITIONAL COST PER TON	Gernatt Asphalt - Springville	WMA ADDITIONAL COST PER TON	Hanspn Aggregates	WMA ADDITIONAL COST PER TON	Spallina Materials	WMA ADDITIONAL COST PER TON
PG54-22 Binder	403.11	Type 1 Base Course	6%	54.95	1.00	58.25	1.25	59.50	1.25	59.00	2.00	<b>54.00</b>	No Bid
	403.13	Type 3 Binder Course	6.50%	57.45	1.00	62.00	1.50	63.50	1.50	62.00	2.00	<b>57.00</b>	No Bid
	403.16	Type 6 Top Course	7.20%	<b>63.90</b>	1.00	67.50	1.75	69.00	1.75	67.00	2.00	64.00	No Bid
	403.19	Type 7F Top Course	7.85%	<b>66.45</b>	1.00	71.00	2.00	72.50	2.00	69.00	2.00	66.50	No Bid
	W403.14	Type 1 Dense Binder	6.25%	58.75	1.00	<b>55.75</b>	1.50	57.25	1.50	62.00	2.00	59.50	No Bid
PG64V-22 Binder	403.11P	Type 1 PM Base Course	6%	57.95	1.00	61.25	1.25	62.50	1.25	61.00	2.00	<b>55.00</b>	No Bid
	403.13P	Type 3 PM Binder Course	6.50%	61.25	1.00	65.00	1.50	66.50	1.50	64.00	2.00	<b>60.25</b>	No Bid
	403.16P	Type 6 PM Top Course	7.20%	68.45	1.00	70.75	1.75	72.25	1.75	71.00	2.00	<b>66.00</b>	No Bid
	403.19P	Type 7F PM Top Course	7.85%	71.45	1.00	75.00	2.00	76.50	2.00	73.00	2.00	<b>68.50</b>	No Bid
Asphalt Delivery	Each Ton	First 6 miles		50.00		5.35		5.35		6.00		5.95	
	Each Mile	6.1 - 15 miles		0.25		0.35		0.35		1.00		0.40	
	Each ADD Mile	over 15.1 miles		0.20		0.30		0.30		0.75		0.30	

WYOMING COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT  
 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE  
 RENTED EQUIPMENT/LABOR

Bid Opened 3/15/22	Bidder	County Line Stone Co	County Line Stone Co		D & H EXCAVATING	D & H EXCAVATING
<b>Rented Equipment/Labor</b>						
<b>Equipment</b>	<b>Labor Included</b>	<b>Daily Rate (8 hrs excluding mobilization)</b>	<b>OT Rate/hr for work over 8 hours</b>		<b>Daily Rate (8 hrs excluding mobilization)</b>	<b>OT Rate/hr for work over 8 hours</b>
10'-20' Asphalt Paver	Operator and Screed Man	3,500.00	425.00		3,600.00	400.00
7' wide Vibratory Steel Drum Roller	Operator	1,675.00	250.00		1,500.00	200.00
	Laborer (Paving/M&PT)	850.00	140.00		835.00	135.00
	Foreman	1,000.00	160.00		1,000.00	150.00
Skid Steer w/bucket Mill Head Attachment	Operator	1,250.00	200.00		1,300.00	175.00
Water Truck	Driver/Laborer	1,100.00	175.00		900.00	150.00
M&PT Supplies and Service Truck	Flaggers (2 each)	2,200.00	280.00		2,000.00	250.00
Mobilization Lowboy	truck and Operator	150.00			150.00	

WYOMING COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT  
 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE  
 RENTED EQUIPMENT/LABOR

Bid Opened 3/15/2022	Bidder	Germatt Asphalt	Germatt Asphalt		Hanson Aggregates	Hanson Aggregates
<b>Rented Equipment/Labor</b>						
<b>Equipment</b>	<b>Labor Included</b>	<b>Daily Rate (8 hrs excluding mobilization)</b>	<b>OT Rate/hr for work over 8 hours</b>		<b>Daily Rate (8 hrs excluding mobilization)</b>	<b>OT Rate/hr for work over 8 hours</b>
10'-20' Asphalt Paver	Operator and Screed Man	4,450.00	835.00		3,850.00	385.00
7' wide Vibratory Steel Drum Roller	Operator	2,050.00	385.00		2,300.00	240.00
	Laborer (Paving/M&PT)	1,050.00	197.00		1,100.00	120.00
	Foreman	N/B	N/B		1,300.00	140.00
Skid Steer w/bucket Mill Head Attachment	Operator	1,950.00	365.00		2,000.00	200.00
Water Truck	Driver/Laborer	1,700.00	320.00		1,400.00	140.00
M&PT Supplies and Service Truck	Flaggers (2 each)	1,050.00	197.00		2,400.00	2,400.00
Mobilization of Eqp. Lowboy	truck and Operator	172.00			150.00	

WYOMING COUNTY HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT  
 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE  
 RENTED EQUIPMENT/LABOR

3/15/2022	Bidder	Keeler Construction	Keeler Construction		Spallina Materials	Spallina Materials
<b>Rented Equipment/Labor</b>						
<b>Equipment</b>	<b>Labor Included</b>	<b>Daily Rate (8 hrs excluding mobilization)</b>	<b>OT Rate/hr for work over 8 hours</b>		<b>Daily Rate (8 hrs excluding mobilization)</b>	<b>OT Rate/hr for work over 8 hours</b>
10'-20' Asphalt Paver	Operator and Screed Man	3,650.00	330.00		3,475.00	375.00
7' wide Vibratory Steel Drum Roller	Operator	2,200.00	230.00		1,800.00	250.00
	Laborer (Paving/M&PT)	950.00	110.00		850.00	125.00
	Foreman	1,050.00	125.00		900.00	130.00
Skid Steer w/bucket Mill Head Attachment	Operator	1,750.00	170.00		1,400.00	180.00
Water Truck	Driver/Laborer	1,100.00	105.00		1,000.00	150.00
M&PT Supplies and Service Truck	Flaggers (2 each)	2,300.00	220.00		2,100.00	250.00
Mobilization of Eqp. Lowboy	truck and Operator	150.00			175.00	N/B

## Truck Hauling

3/15/2022

Bidder

**Rented Equipment/Labor**

**Company: County Line Stone**

Equipment	Labor Included	Minimun/Maximun Capacity (tons)	Hourly Rate	Total Travel Time Allowed per Day
Tandem Axel	Driver	0-20	\$94.00	1 hour
Tri Axel	Driver	0-24	\$98.00	1 hour
Truck with Trailer	Driver	0-36	\$130.00	1 hour
Flowboy	Driver	0-38	\$145.00	1hour

**Rented Equipment/Labor**

**Company: D & H Excavating**

Equipment	Labor Included	Minimun/Maximun Capacity (tons)	Hourly Rate	Total Travel Time Allowed per Day
Tandem Axel	Driver	0-21	\$95.00	1 Hour
Tri Axel	Driver	0-24	\$95.00	1 Hour
Truck with Trailer	Driver	0-20	\$120.00	1 Hour

**Rented Equipment/Labor**

**Company: Gernatt Asphalt**

Equipment	Labor Included	Minimun/Maximun Capacity (tons)	Hourly Rate	Total Travel Time Allowed per Day
Tandem Axel	Driver	0-22.5	\$150.00	1 HOUR
Tri Axel	Driver	0-22.5	\$150.00	1 HOUR
Truck with Trailer	Driver	0-35	N/B	1 HOUR

**Rented Equipment/Labor**

**Company: Hanson Aggregates**

Equipment	Labor Included	Minimun/Maximun Capacity (tons)	Hourly Rate	Total Travel Time Allowed per Day
Tandem Axel	Driver	20-22	\$120.00	1 HOUR
Tri Axel	Driver	20-22	\$120.00	1 HOUR
Truck with Trailer	Driver	28-32	\$150.00	1 HOUR

## Truck Hauling

Bid Opened 3/15/22

Bidder

Rented Equipment/Labor

**Company: Spallina**

Equipment	Labor Included	Minimun/Maximun Capacity (tons)	Hourly Rate	Total Travel Time Allowed per Day
Tandem Axel	Driver	0-20	\$150.00	1 HOUR
Tri Axel	Driver	20-22	\$150.00	1 HOUR
Truck with Trailer	Driver	30-35	\$195.00	1 HOUR

Rented Equipment/Labor

**Company: HOJNOWSKI**

Equipment	Labor Included	Minimun/Maximun Capacity (tons)	Hourly Rate	** Total Travel Time Allowed per Day **
Tandem Axel	Driver	MAX - 22	N/B	.5 HOUR
Tri Axel	Driver	MAX - 23	N/B	.5 HOUR
Truck with Trailer	Driver	MAX - 35	N/B	.5 HOUR
STONE SLINGER	Driver	MAX - 22	N/B	.5 HOUR

\*\*\*1 HOUR IF NOT 6HR DAY

Rented Equipment/Labor

**Company: ED HULME INC**

Equipment	Labor Included	Minimun/Maximun Capacity (tons)	Hourly Rate	Total Travel Time Allowed per Day
Tandem Axel	Driver	MAX - 21	\$120.00	
Tri Axel	Driver	MAX - 22	\$120.00	
Truck with Trailer	Driver	MAX - 30	N/B	

\*\*\*\* Ed Hulme reserves the right to adjust pricing based on rising fuel cost